NLP AM TY CCDE 13404-10 C6 2/1/08 #102372

Sect i
Sect i
Sect i
Sect i
Sect i
Sect i
Sect i
Sect i

Sect i
Sect i
Sect i

on
on
on
on
on
on
on
on

on
on
on

101.
102.
103.
104.
105.
106.
107.
108.

201.
202.
208.

CHAPTER VI

CODE ENFORCEMENT

Part 1
Uni f orm Constructi on Code

El ection to Adm ni ster and Enforce
Adoption of Uniform Construction Code
Revi sions to Uni form Constructi on Code
Admi ni stration and Enforcenment of Code
Board of Appeal s

Previ ously Adopted Codes

Fees

Severability

Part 2
I nternational Property Mintenance Code
Adoption of International Property Mintenance Code

Revi sions to International Property Mintenance Code
Severability

V-1



NLP AM TY CCDE 13404-10 C6 2/1/08 #102372

Part 1

Uni f orm Constructi on Code

Section 101. FElection to Adninister and Enforce. The Township of Amty,
Berks County, Pennsylvania (the “Township”) hereby elects to adnminister and
enforce the provisions of the Pennsylvania Constructi on Code Act, Act 45 of 1999,
35 P.S. §7210.101-7210. 1103, as anended fromtine to tine (the “Act”), and its
regul ations. (Ordinance 202-A, June 29, 2004, Section 6)

Section 102. Adoption of Uniform Construction Code. The Uniform
Construction Code, contained in 34 Pa. Code, Chapters 401-405, as anended from
time to tine, is hereby adopted and incorporated herein by reference as the
muni ci pal building code of the Townshi p. (Ordinance 202-A, June 29, 2004
Section 6)

Section 103. Revi sions to Uniform Construction Code. The foll ow ng
additions, insertions, deletions and changes are hereby nmade to the Uniform
Construction Code:

(a) The International Building Code, 2003 Edition, is hereby
revised as foll ows:

(1) Section 1612.3 Insert - Township of Amty.
(2) Section 1612.3 Insert - Decenber 1, 1997.
(3) Section 3410.2 Insert - January 7, 1972.

(b) The I nt ernati onal Code Counci | El ectri cal Code -
Admi ni strative Provisions, 2003 Edition, is hereby revised as foll ows:

(1) Section 101.1 Insert - Township of Amty.

(2) Section 404.2 Insert - Fees assessable by the Township
for the administration and enforcement undertaken pursuant to this
particul ar code shall be established by the Board of Supervisors of
the Township by resolution fromtime to time.

(c) The I nternational Energy Conservation Code, 2003 Edition, is
hereby revised as foll ows:

(1) Section 101.1 Insert - Township of Amty.

(d) The International Existing Building Code, 2003 Edition, is
hereby revised as foll ows:

(1) Section 101.1 Insert - Township of Amty.

(2) Section 1201.2 Insert - January 7, 1972.

(3) Inclusion - Appendix B entitled “Supplenmentary
accessibility requirements for existing buildings and facilities” is

her eby adopt ed.

(e) The International Fire Code, 2003 Edition, is hereby revised
as follows:

VI -2



NLP AM TY CCDE 13404-10 C6 2/1/08 #102372

(1) Section 101.1 Insert - Township of Amty.

(2) Section 109.3 Insert - “Summary O fense”, “(Cne Thousand
Dol lars ($1,000.00)” and “thirty (30)”".

(3) Section 111.4 Insert - $100.00 and $1, 000. 00.

(f) The International Fuel Gas Code, 2003 Edition, is hereby
revised as follows:

(1) Section 101.1 Insert - Township of Amty.

(2) Section 106.5.2 Insert - Fees assessabl e by the Township
for the administration and enforcement undertaken pursuant to this
particul ar code shall be established by the Board of Supervisors of
the Township by resolution fromtime to time.

(3) Section 106.5.3 Insert - 75% and 75%

(4) Section 108.4 Insert - “Summary O fense”, “Cne Thousand
Dol lars ($1,000.00)” and “thirty (30)”".

(5) Section 108.5 Insert - $100.00 and $1, 000. 00.

(6) Inclusion - Appendix A entitled “Sizing and capacities
of gas piping” in hereby adopted.

(7) Inclusion - Appendix B entitled “Sizing of venting
systens serving appliances equipped with draft hoods, category |
appl i ances, and appliances listed for use and Type B vents” is
her eby adopt ed.

(8) Inclusion - Appendix C entitled ‘Exit terminals of
nmechani cal draft and direct-vent venting systens” is hereby adopted.

(9) The International Mechanical Code, 2003 edition, is hereby
revised as foll ows:

(1) Section 101.1 Insert - Township of Amty.

(2) Section 106.5.2 Insert - Fees assessabl e by the Township
for the administration and enforcement undertaken pursuant to this
particul ar code shall be established by the Board of Supervisors of
the Township by resolution fromtime to time.

(3) Section 106.5.3 Insert - 75% and 75%

(4) Section 108.4 Insert - “Summary O fense”, One Thousand
Dol lars ($1,000.00)” and “thirty (30)”".

(5) Section 108.5 Insert - $100.00 and $1, 000. 00.

(h) The International Code Council Performance Code for Buil dings
and Facilities, 2003 Edition, is not nodified at this tine.

(1) The International Plunbing Code, 2003 edition, is hereby
revi sed as foll ows:

(1) Section 101.1 Insert - Township of Amty.

VI -3



NLP AM TY CCDE 13404-10 C6 2/1/08 #102372

(2) Section 106.6.2 Insert - Fees assessabl e by the Township
for the administration and enforcement undertaken pursuant to this
particul ar code shall be established by the Board of Supervisors of
the Township by resolution fromtinme to time.

(3) Section 106.6.3 Insert - 75% and 75%

(4) Section 108.4 Insert - “Summary O fense”, “(Cne Thousand
Dol lars ($1,000.00)", and thirty (30).

(5) Section 108.5 Insert - $100.00 and $1, 000. 00.
(6) Section 305.6.1 Insert - 24 inches and 36 inches.
(7) Section 904.1 Insert - 18 inches.

(8) Inclusion - Appendix B entitled “Rates of rainfall for
various cities” is hereby adopted.

(9) Inclusion - Appendix D entitled “Degree day and design
tenmperatures” is hereby adopted.

(10) Inclusion - Appendix F entitled “Structural safety” is
her eby adopt ed.

(j) The International Residential Code, 2003 edition, is hereby
revised as foll ows:

(1) Section R101.1 Insert - Township of Amity.

(2) Tabl e R301.2(1) Insert the followi ng Design Criteria:
a) Ground Snow Load - 30 pounds.
b) W nd Speed - 90 nph.

c) Sei sm ¢ Design Category — B.

d) Weat hering — Severe.

e) Frost |ine depth - 30".

f) Termite - noderate to heavy.

0) Decay - Slight to nopderate.

h) Wnter Design Tenp - See Appendix D of the

International Plunbing Code, 2003 - Degree day and design
t emper at ur es.

i) Fl ood Hazards - See Townshi p Zoni ng Ordi nance
i) Air Freezing Index — 1000.
k) Mean Annual Tenperature - 50 degrees F

(3) Section P2603.6.1 Insert - 24 inches and 36 inches.

(4) Section P3103.1 Insert - 18 inches.

VI -4



NLP AM TY CCDE 13404-10 C6 2/1/08 #102372

(5) Inclusion - Appendix A entitled “Sizing and capacities
of gas piping” is hereby adopted.

(6) Inclusion - Appendix B entitled “Sizing of venting
systens serving appliances equipped with draft hoods, category |
appl i ances, and appliances listed for use with Type B vents” is
her eby adopt ed.

(7) Inclusion - Appendix C entitled “Exit terminals of
mechani cal draft and direct-venting systems” is hereby adopted.

(8) I ncl usion - Appendix F entitled “Radon control methods”
i s hereby adopt ed.

(k) The International U ban-WIldland Interface Code, 2003 Edition
is hereby revised as foll ows:

(1) Section 101.1 Insert - Township of Amty.

(1) Secton 403.1(a) of the Uniform Construction Code is hereby
amended by addi ng the foll owi ng subsecti on:

(1) The Uni form Constructi on Code shall also apply to all
residential utility and miscellaneous use structures with a buil ding
area of nore than five hundred (500) square feet.

(Ordi nance 202-A, June 29, 2004, Section 6, as anended by Odinance 209,
January 18, 2005, Section 1)

Section 104. Adnministration and Enforcenent of Code. Administration and
enforcenent of the Code within the Township shall be undertaken in any of the
foll owi ng ways as determ ned by the Board of Supervisors of the Township from
time to time by resolution:

(a) By the designation of an enpl oyee of the Township to serve as
the Township Building Code Oficial to act on behalf of the Townshi p.

(b) By the retention of one or nore construction code officials or
third-party agencies to act on behal f of the Townshi p.

(c) By agreenent with one or nore other nunicipalities for the
joint admnistration and enforcenment of the Act through an inter-municipal
agr eenent .

(d) By entering into a contract with another municipality for the
admi ni stration and enforcement of the Act on behalf of the Township.

(e) By entering into an agreenment with the Pennsyl vani a Depart ment
of Labor and Industry for plan review, inspections and enforcenent of
structures other than one-famly or two-family dwelling units and utility
and mi scel | aneous use structures.

(Ordi nance 202-A, June 29, 2004, Section 6)

Section 105. Board of Appeals. A Board of Appeals shall be established by
resol ution of the Board of Supervisors of the Township in conformty with the
requi rements of the relevant provisions of the Code, as anmended fromtine to
time, and for the purposes set forth therein. |If at any tinme enforcenent and
adm ni stration is undertaken jointly with one or nore other nunicipalities, said
Board of Appeals shall be established by joint action of the participating
nmuni ci palities. (Ordinance 202-A, June 29, 2004, Section 6)

VI -5



NLP AM TY CCDE 13404-10 C6 2/1/08 #102372

Section 106. Previously Adopted Codes.

(a) Al'l building code ordinances or portions of ordinances which
wer e adopted by the Township on or before July 1, 1999 and whi ch equal or
exceed the requirenents of the Code shall continue in full force and
effect until such time as such provisions fail to equal or exceed the
m ni mum requi renents of the Code, as amended fromtine to tine.

(b) Al'l building code ordinances or portions of ordinances which
are in effect as of the effective date of this Part and whose requiremnents
are less than the mnimumrequirenents of the Code are hereby amended to
conformw th the conparabl e provisions of the Code.

(c) Al'l relevant ordinances, regulations and policies of the
Townshi p not governed by the Code shall remain in full force and effect.

(Ordi nance 202-A, June 29, 2004, Section 6)

Section 107. Fees. Fees assessable by the Township for the adm nistration
and enforcement wundertaken pursuant to this Part and the Code shall be
est abl i shed by the Board of Supervisors of the Township by resolution fromtine
to time. (Ordinance 202-A, June 29, 2004, Section 6)

Section 108. Severability. |If any sentence, clause, section or part of
this Part is for any reason found to be unconstitutional, illegal or invalid,
such unconstitutionality, illegality or invalidity shall not affect or inpair any

of the remai ning provisions, sentences, clauses, sections or parts of this Part.

It is hereby declared as the intent of the Board of Supervisors of the Township
that this Part woul d have been adopted had such unconstitutional, illegal or
invalid sentence, clause, section or part thereof not been included herein.
(Ordi nance 202-A, June 29, 2004, Section 6)

VI -6



NLP AM TY CCDE 13404-10 C6 2/1/08 #102372

Part 2

I nternational Property Mintenance Code

Section 201. Adoption of International Property Mintenance Code. A
certain docunent, three (3) copies of which are on file in the office of the
Secretary of the Township of Amty, being nmarked and designated as the
International Property Mintenance Code, 2003 Edition, as published by the

I nternational Code Council, be and is hereby adopted as the Property Maintenance
Code of the Township of Amty, in the Commonwealth of Pennsylvania, for
regul ating and governing the conditions and nmaintenance of all property,

bui | di ngs and structures; by providing the standards for supplied utilities and
facilities and other physical things and conditions essential to ensure that
structures are safe, sanitary and fit for occupation and use; and the
condemmati on of buildings and structures unfit for human occupancy and use, and
for the denolition of such existing structures as herein provided; providing for
the issuance of pernits and collection of fees therefor; and each and all of the
regul ati ons, provisions, penalties, conditions and terms of said Property
Mai nt enance Code on file in the office of the Township of Amity are hereby
referred to, adopted, and made a part hereof, as if fully set out in this
Section. (Odinance 202-A, June 29, 2004, Section 7)

Section 202. Revisions to International Property M ntenance Code. The
followi ng additions, insertions, deletions and changes are hereby made to the
I nternational Property Mintenance Code

(a) Section 101.1 Insert - Township of Amty.
(b) The Title of Section 103 shall read as follows:

BUI LDI NG CODE OFFI Cl AL AND DEPUTI ES
(c) Section 103.1 shall read as foll ows:

Creation of the Ofice of the Building Code Oficial. The
of fice of Building Code Oficial is hereby created and the executive
official (s) in charge thereof shall be known as the Buil ding Code
Oficial.

(d) Section 103.2 shall read as foll ows:

Appoi ntment. The Building Code Official shall be appoi nted by
the Board of Supervisors and shall serve at the pleasure of the
Board of Supervisors.

(e) Section 103.5 shall read as foll ows:

Fees. The fees for all work, permts, charges, etc. shall be
paid in accordance with the fee schedul e resolution in effect at the
time application is made.

(f) The Title of Section 104.7 shall read as follows:

Bui |l ding Code Official’s Records.

(9) Subsection 106.3 shall read as foll ows:

VI -7



NLP AM TY CCDE 13404-10 C6 2/1/08 #102372

Prosecution of violation. Persons who shall violate a
provision of this Code, fail to conply with any of the requirenents
thereof or erect, install, alter or repair work in violation of the

approved construction docunents or directive of the Building Code
Oficial, or of a permit or certificate issued under the provisions
of this Code, shall be guilty of a summary of fense, punishable by a
fine of not nore than $1,000. per violation. Each day that a
viol ation continues after due notice has been served shall be deened
a separate of fense

(h) Subsection 107.4 is hereby revised by deleting the reference

to Section 106.4 and substituting "106.3."

(1) Section 111 is hereby deleted in its entirety. A new

Section 111 is hereby enacted to read as foll ows:

addi ti

"owner
court"”

addi ti

addi ti

Appeal s. The creation of the board of appeals and its
authority and qualifications and the filing of appeals shall be in
accordance with Sections 403.121 and 403. 122 contained in 34 PA Code
Chapter, 403.

(j) Section 202 is hereby revised to include the follow ng
onal definitions:

Qccupi ed. As applied to a building or portion thereof, shal
be construed as though foll owed by the words, "or intended, arranged
or designed to be occupied, or having a certificate of use and
occupancy”.

One Family Dwelling. A building containing one dwelling
unit.

Two Fanmily Dwelling. A building containing two dwelling
units.

(k) Section 202 is hereby anmended as follows: in the definition of
" the phrase "if ordered to take possession of real property by a
is hereby deleted fromthe definition.

(1) Section 301 is hereby anmended to include the follow ng
onal subsection known as 301. 2. 1:

VWere properties abut a public right-of-way, the abutting
property owner shall be responsible for the maintenance of the area
between their property line and the cartway, including the curb, the
si dewal k and grass areas between the curb and the property |ine.

(m Section 302 is hereby anmended to include the follow ng
onal subsection known as 302. 3. 1:

VWere sidewal ks exist, those responsible (see Section 301.2.1
as anmended) for the sidewal ks shall have at |east a two-foot w de
pat h cl eared of snow and ice within 24 hours after the cessation of
the snowfal |

EXCEPTI ON:  When nore than twelve (12) inches of snow has
fallen, those responsible for the sidewal k shall have at |east a
two-foot wi de path cleared of snow and ice within 48 hours after the
cessation of the snowfall

VI -8



NLP AM TY CCDE 13404-10 C6 2/1/08 #102372

(n) Section 302.4 is hereby anended to insert ten (10) inches in

hei ght for (jurisdiction to insert height in inches).

(0) Section 302 is hereby anmended to include the follow ng

addi ti onal subsection known as 302. 4. 2:

addi t

The Buil ding Code Oficial, or any officer or enployee of the
Townshi p desi gnated thereby for this purpose, is hereby authorized
to give notice, by personal service or United States mail, to the
owner or occupant or any adult person in charge of said prenises, as
the case nmay be, of any property wherein grass or other vegetation
is in violation of Section 302.4 or Section 302.4.1, directing and
requiring such occupant or owner to renmpve, trimor cut such grass,
weeds or vegetation so as to conformto the requirenents of this
ordi nance, within 5 days after issuance of such notice.

Whenever, in the judgnent of the Building Code Official, it
shal | appear to be inpracticable to give notice as above provided,
ei t her because the owner or occupant cannot readily be found, or
because a search for the owner or occupant woul d entail unreasonable
del ay, the Township or any officer or enployee of the Township
designated thereby for that purpose, may give notice by posting
conspi cuously on the property where such nui sance exists, a notice
or order directing and requiring that such nui sance be abated within
5 days.

In case any person, firmor corporation shall neglect, fail or
refuse to conply with such notice within the period of tine stated
therein, the Township nay order the renoval, trimrming or cutting of
such grass, weeds or vegetation, and the cost thereof, together with

a penalty of ten percent (10% of the cost thereof shall be
col l ected by the Township from such person, firmor corporation, in
t he manner provided by law and may be entered as a nunicipal lien

against the property and owner thereof, for the abatenent of
nui sance.

(p) Section 302.8 shall read as foll ows:

Mot or vehi cl es. Only one intact inoperative or unlicensed
not or vehicle shall be parked, stored, or kept on any prem ses. A
vehicle of any type is permtted to undergo major overhaul
i ncl udi ng body work, provided that such work is performed inside a
structure or simlarly enclosed area designed and approved for such
pur poses.

(a) Section 302 is hereby anmended to include the follow ng
onal subsection known as 302. 8. 1:

Regi stered motor vehicles are prohibited from parking on any
non- paved area in the front or side yards of a property for a period
of greater than 12 hours. Mdtor vehicles may be parked on non-paved
areas in the rear yard providing that a solid fence, a nminimumof 6
feet tall, is erected around the rear yard in order to screen the
contents of the yard from surroundi ng nei ghbors.

(r) Section 304.14 substitute "May 15th" for the first reference

of [DATE], and "October 15th" for the second reference of [DATE].

(s) Section 602.3 substitute "Cctober 1st" for the first reference

of [DATE], and "May 1st" for the second reference of [DATE].

VI -9



NLP AM TY CCDE 13404-10 C6 2/1/08 #102372

(t) Section 602.4 substitute "Cctober 1st" for the first reference
of [DATE], and "May 1st" for the second reference of [DATE].

(u) Substitute in all relevant Sections of the Code "Buil di ng Code
Oficial" for [ THE BU LDl NG OFFI Cl AL] .

(v) Substitute in all relevant Sections of the Code "the Board of
Supervi sors" for [ THE GOVERNI NG BODY] .

(Ordi nance 202-A, June 29, 2004, Section 7)

Section 203. Severability. |If any sentence, clause, section or part of
this Part is for any reason found to be unconstitutional, illegal or invalid,
such unconstitutionality, illegality or invalidity shall not affect or inpair any

of the remai ning provisions, sentences, clauses, sections or parts of this Part.

It is hereby declared as the intent of the Board of Supervisors of the Township
that this Part woul d have been adopted had such unconstitutional, illegal or
invalid sentence, clause, section or part thereof not been included herein.
(Ordi nance 202-A, June 29, 2004, Section 7)

VI -10



